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Date issued: 05 June 2020 
 
Rescue funding package 
 
Thank you for your Freedom of Information (FOI) Act request of 5 May. The reply to your 
individual requests is set out below:  

 
1. In respect of the first full month when the additional funding applied, how much 
additional funding did Transport for Wales pay for provision of Wales and Borders train 
services (i.e. services operated by Transport for Wales Rail Services)? 
Additional funding of £6.7m was provided to TfW Rail Services in relation to RP2013. 
 
2. In respect of the first full month when the additional funding applied, how much 
additional funding did Transport for Wales pay to other train operating companies, e.g. 
Great Western Railway? – none, as TfW does not provide funding to GWR as GWR is a 
DfT-managed franchise.  
None. TfW does not provide funding to GWR as GWR is a DfT-managed franchise. 
 
3. In respect of the first full month when the additional funding applied, which 10 bus 
companies received the largest payments from the Welsh Government’s £29m funding? 
We do not hold this information.  
 
4. How much additional funding was paid to each of the 10 largest recipients of the 
£29m bus funding in respect of the first full month when the additional funding 
applied? 
We do not hold this information. 
 
 

If you have any queries, please do not hesitate to contact Transport for Wales. 

Yours sincerely  

Transport for Wales 


