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Date issued:  17th of November 2025

Freedom of Information Request 279/25

You asked us…

Under the Freedom of Information Act, I would be grateful if you could provide the following information regarding your organisation’s use of Computer Aided Facilities Management (CAFM) or Integrated Workplace Management Systems (IWMS) or similar operational management platforms.

1) Which CAFM or IWMS systems are currently used?

2) When procuring or implementing software solutions, what is the typical contract length agreed with suppliers? Are there any upcoming renewals of your current arrangements?

3) Approximately what is the typical annual cost associated with these systems?
a) up to £50k
b) up to £75k
c) up to £100k
d) over £100k

4) Does the organisation use a single integrated solution or multiple systems to cover areas such as maintenance, assets property, leases, compliance or project delivery?

5) Do you integrate these systems to other organisation systems? e.g. finance, HR, GIS

6) Was the implementation part of a wider estates or digital transformation initiative?

7) Are there any challenges or limitations with your current system/s? Are there plans to enhance or adopt any new technologies? e.g. AI.

8) Has the use of these systems supported wider goals? e.g. efficiency, sustainability, data-driven decision making?

RESPONSE

Question 1

Our FM Provider captures all data on a system called V-Nexus as our CAFM system. This is the central portal where data is stored.

The V-Nexus system is a Computer-Aided Facility Management (CAFM) system used by VINCI Facilities, which is built around IBM Maximo Asset Management software. It is an integrated suite of software and reporting tools that connects facilities management teams and customers for managing work processes. 




Question 2

The answer would be different for various software implementations. For the CAFM, this is paid as a service under our existing total facilities management outsourced contract with Vinci.
The current contract was put in place for an initial period of 3 years with the option to extend for up to two periods of 12 months each. The initial contract term expires in April 2026 with the potential for renewal by April 2028.

Question 3

Up to 50k
Question 4

As question 1.

Question 5

No

Question 6

Not recorded.

Question 7

Not recorded.

Question 8

Not recorded.

We hope this information is of use to you.

Yours sincerely,  
 
Transport for Wales

Appeal Rights
If you are unhappy with the way your request has been handled and wish to make a complaint or request a review of our decision, please write to the Head of Freedom of Information at either Transport for Wales, 3 Llys Cadwyn, Pontypridd, CF37 4TH or freedomofinformation@tfw.wales. Your request must be submitted within 40 working days of receipt of this letter. If you are not content with the outcome of the internal review, you have the right to apply directly to the Information Commissioner for a decision. 
The Information Commissioner (ICO) can be contacted at Information Commissioner's Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9 5AF or you can contact the ICO through the 'Make a Complaint' section of their website on this link: https://ico.org.uk/make-a-complaint/ 
The relevant section to select will be "Official or Public Information".
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